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P S Director of Athletics

Hamden Public Schools

Application for Coaches

All coaches, including volunteers need to be certified coaches and must hold a valid Connecticut State Coaching
Permit. All coaches will have to do the following in order to be a certified coach for Hamden Public Schools.

Coaches that do not hold a Connecticut Teaching Certificate will need to complete a 45 hour coaching course prior to
the season and fill out the application. To register and to find dates, times and locations for the coaching course go to

mmmmmtmnmml When course is complete fill out the Five-Year Renewable Coaching
Application or apply online at Za= =

{Ifyou hold a valid Connecticut Teaching Certificate you will not have to take the 45 hour course and can submit a copy
of your teaching certificate to the Athletic Department with the rest of the required paperwork.}

Once you take the 45 hour class to obtain the 5 year renewable CT State Coaching Permit you will be required to
submit the following:

A signed copy of your First Aid and CPR card

A copy of your high school diploma or official high school or college transcripts

A certificate of completion for the Concussion Management Course Module 15. The course is available online at

htp:// hinged.org/onli A

An original certificate verifying the completion of an approved 45 hour coaching course.

When the application is complete bring copies of your completed application packet to the Athletic Office for our files.
(WE WILL SUBMIT THE PAPERWORK TO THE STATE ON YOUR BEHALF. We want to ensure the paperwork is

complete so you can begin coaching)

When you receive your permit from the State bring a copy to the Athletic Office for our files.

Complete Coach Informatien Sheet w/References at bottom of the page.

Resume on file with Athletic Office

When hired, the Athletic Director will direct you when to complete the Employment Application for all new hires at
Hamden Public Schools, Personnel Qffice, 60 Putnam Ave,, Hamden, CT. This application includes the Completion of
Criminal Records/Fingerprinting Check and CT-W4 forms necessary for payroll purposes.

All forms need to be completely filled out and submitted prior to your first day of coaching.

Office Use Only
5 Year Coaching Permit Y N NA
Emergency Permit Y N NA
CPR Y N
1% Aid Y N
Meod 15 (Concussion) Y N
HS Diploma/Official Trancscripts Y N
Coaches Info Sheet Y N
Fingerprints Y N
Resume Y N

Hamden High School, Athletic Dept., 2040 Dixwell Ave., Hamden, CT 06514 « 203-407-2040 ext. 3001 « Fax 203-407-3115
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Hamden Public Schools

Coaches Information

Date: Sport; Position;

Name:

Address:

Email Address:

Cell Phone:

Home Phone:

Work Phone:

Hamden Public Schools requires that we call and check references when hiring coaches. Please
provide the Athletic Department with at least 3 references.

References
1. Name of Reference; Position:
Phone #: email;
2. Name of Reference: Position:
Phone #: email;
3. Name of Reference: Position:

Phone #: email:
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APPLICATION FOR FIVE-YEAR RENEWABLE COACHING PERMIT
PART I PERSONAL INFORMATION (Print all information in bluc ink and in uppercase letters.)

UUuooiidooboodgaooaadooon

LAST NAME
OO Uauoobotodn u [
FIRST NAME GENDER (M/F)
O O-OE-u e LO-L-0uto
SOCIAL SECURITY NUMBER BIRTH DATE (Month-Day-Year) ~ Required
LD D0HOO000000d800 OO0od
ADDRESS (Street) (Apt#)
LU oUDODO0LO00LooonoDood
(City)
0 OO00t] D 00 FORMER LAST NAME(S)
{Statc) {Zip Code)
PHONE DDD = L__| D D - D l:I DD Race/Ethnicity 1. Native Amenican
(Home/Cell) D 2. Asian/Pacific Islander
3. Black
E-MAIL ADDRESS {Optional) 4. White
5. Hispanic
1. Have you ever been convicted of any crime, excluding minor traffic violations? YES D NO Lj
2. Have you ever been dismissed for cause from any position? YES D NC D
3. Have you ever surrendered a professional certificate, license, permit or other credential YES [:| NO D

(including, but not limited to, an cducation credential); had one revoked, suspended,
annulled, invalidated, rejected or denied for cause; or been the subject of any other
adverse or disciplinary credential action?

Pursuant to Connecticut General Statutes Section 10-221d, the State Board of Education must complete a criminal history
records check on cach applicant for an initial issuance or rencwal of a certificate, authorization or permit. Each applicant
secking an initial issuance or renewal of a certificate, authorization or permit must also submit to a records check of the
Department of Children and Families’ child abuse and neglect registry established pursuant to Connecticut General Statutes
Scction 17a-101k. In addition, the State Board of Education is required to submit periodically for a criminal history records
check the database of all persons who hold any certificate, authorization or permit.

NOTE: Il you answer “YES” to any of the above questions, you must atiach a signed statement of explanation. If there are
multiple incidents within each question, you must list and explain each scparately. Submit official copics of court or adminis-
trative record(s), including disposition of cach case.

Information on this application is subject to disclosure pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act.

. PAGE 1
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PART I{: COMPLETION OF REQUIRED FIRST AID COURSE

The first aid course must have been completed within 3 yeass prior to the date of application. Please sign your first aid card and attach: (1) a
photacopy of both the front and back of the first aid card, or (2) original certificate of completion, to this application.

Name of course completed Daie of completion

PART III: COMPLETION OF REQUIRED CPR COURSE

Please sign your valid CPR card and aitach: (1) a photocopy of both the front und back of the CPR card, or (2) original certificate of
complction, to this application.

Name of course completed Date of completion

PART IV: HIGH SCHOOL INFORMATION

Please attach a copy of your high school diploma or official high school transcript to this application.
PART V: CONCUSSION AND HEAD INJURY TRAINING REQUIREMENT

Attach the original certificate of completion of the concussion and head injury training requircment (Module 15) from the Connecticul
Coaching Education Program (CCEP).

PART V1: COMPLETION OF REQUIRED COACHING COURSE

(For individuals NOT holding a valid Connecticut educator certificate, or a standard or permanent certificate)

Course completed at: Date course completed:
(Name of college/university or board of education)

PART VII: RENEWAL OF FIVE-YEAR RENEWABLE COACHING PERMIT

Have you completed at Jeast 15 clock hours of seminars, course work or workshops which provide |_|YES | _NO
information on safe and healthful coaching practices and understanding child and adolescent development
as approved by the State Department of Education?

On or afier July 1, 2010, through June 30, 2015, completion of the concussion and head injury training requirement (Module |5) from the
Connecticut Coaching Education Program (CCEP).

After July 1, 2015, completion of the refresher course completed through the CCEP.

PART VUI: APPLICANT ATTESTATION

I certify that the information provided by me on this application and nuy accompanying documents contains no material misrepresentations,
falsifications or omissions and that all of the information given by me is true, complete and accurate. I understand that all application and

sccompanying information may be verified and that ony material misrepresentation, falsification or omission may result in the denial or
revacation of my certificate(s), permit(s) or autherization(s). [ further certify that I have attained the age of ot least 18 years.

ORIGINAL SIGNATURE OF APPLICANT DATE:

Original Signature Must Be On Form Submitted
. PAGE 2
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INSTRUCTIONS TO APPLICATION FOR
FIVE-YEAR RENEWABLE COACHING PERMIT

Listed below are the required documents which must be submitted to the Bureau of Educator Standards and
Certification to process your request for the issuance or renewal of a Five-Year Renewable Coaching Permit.

For the ISSUANCE of a Five-Year Renewable Coaching Permit you must complete and submit the following:

Applicant:

fiiil b R

L] 2

If you do NOT hold a valid Connecticut educator certificate, or a standard or permanent certificate, please com-

plete sections a through g of the instructions below.

Ifyou hold a valid Connecticut educator certificate, or a standard or permanent certificate, please complete sec-
tions a, b, ¢, fand g of the instructions below.

Instructions:

. Complete Parts I through VI and Part VII of the application. (Applicants who hold a valid Connecticut educator

certificate, or a standard or permanent certificate, need not complete Parts I'V or VI).

. Attach a photocopy of your valid Standard First Aid card, or original certificate of completion. The Standard First

Aid course must be completed within threc years prior to the date of application. Please remember to sign your
Standard First Aid card prior to photocopying.

. Attach a photocopy of your valid CPR card, or original certificate of completion. Please remember to sign your

CPR card prior to photocopying.

. Attach a photocopy of your high school diploma or its equivalent. An official high school transcript may be sub-

mitted in licu of a copy of your diploma.

c. Official transcript/certificate verifying the completion of an approved coaching course.

f.

Attach the original certificate of completion of the concussion and head injury training requirement (Module 15)
from the Connecticut Coaching Education Program (CCEP).

. Return completed application and attachments to the Burcau of Educator Standards and Certification.

{continued)

Information on this application is subject to disclosure pursuant to the Freedom of Information Act.



For the RENEWAL of a Five-Year Renewable Coaching Permit:
Instructions:
a. Complete Parts I through 117 and Parts VI and VIIIL
b. Attach a photocopy of your Standard First Aid card, or original certificate of completion. The Standard First Aid
course must be valid for the renewal date of the permit. Please remember to sign your Standard First Aid

card prior to photocopying.

c. Attach a photocopy of your CPR card, or original certificate of complction, valid for the renewal datc of the
permit after course. Please remember to sign your CPR card prior to photocopying.

d. On or after July 1, 2010, through June 30, 2015, attach original certificate of completion of the concussion and
head injury training requircment (Module 15) from the Connecticut Coaching Education Program (CCEP).
After July 1, 2015, attach official verification of the refresher course completed through the CCEP.
¢. Return completed application and attachments to the Burcau of Educator Standards and Certification.
NOTE: Please do NOT submit verification of completion of the required 15 clock hours of seminars, course work or
worksheps for the renewal of the Five-Year Renewable Coaching Permit with this application. Applicants selected for a

random audit will be notified in writing, and be required to submit verification,

Please submit the application for renewal no sooner than six mouths prior to the expiration date of your current perniit.

| Haow to contact the Burcau of Educutor Standards and Ceritification:

E-mail: teacher.cert@ct.gov
Website: www.ct.gov/sde
FAX: 860-713-7017

PHONE:  860-713-6969 24-hour Intcractive Voice Response (EVR) for applicants.
(To speak with a staff member, call the IVR weekdays, between 1-5 p.m.)



